Amendments To The International Building Code, 2006 Edition.

(A)

(B)
Code"

(©)

(D)

(E)

(F)

Section 101.1 “Title” Is Hereby Is Amended To Read As Follows:

These Regulations Shall Be Known As The Building Code Of The City Of
Northglenn, Hereinafter, Referred To As “This Code.”

Section 101.4.1 Is Hereby Amended By Changing The “ICC Electrical
To The “National Electrical Code”.

Section 105.2 “Work Exempt From Permit” Is Amended As Follows:
(1) Delete Section 105.2, Buildings, Exception 1 In Its Entirety.
(2) Delete Section 105.2, Buildings, Exception 2 In Its Entirety.

Section 105.7 Is Hereby Amended To Read As Follows:

The Building Permit And Inspection Card Shall Be Kept On The Site Of
The Work Until The Completion Of The Project And Be Readily Accessible
To The Inspector During Any Inspections.

Section 106.1.1 Is Hereby Amended To Read As Follows:

Construction Documents Shall Be Dimensioned And Drawn To Scale
Upon Suitable Material. Electronic Media Documents Are Permitted To Be
Submitted When Approved By The Building Official. Construction
Documents Shall Be Of Sufficient Clarity To Indicate The Location, Nature
And Extent Of The Work Proposed And Show In Detail That It Will
Conform To The Provisions Of This Code And Relevant Laws,
Ordinances, Rules And Regulations, As Determined By The Building
Official.

Section 106.1.1.1 Is Hereby Amended To Read As Follows:

Shop Drawings For The Fire Protection System(S) Shall Be Submitted
Prior To The Issuance Of A Building Permit To Indicate Conformance With
This Code And The Construction Documents And Shall Be Approved Prior
To The Start Of System Installation By Fire Code And Building Officials.
Shop Drawings Shall Contain All Information As Required By The
Referenced Installation Standards In Chapter 9.

Exception: An Applicant May Request For Fire Protection System
Shop Drawings To Be A Deferred Submittal. The Request Shall Be
In Writing To The Building Official. The Building Official May Allow
A Deferred Submittal For A Specific Amount Of Time After The
Issuance Of The Building Permit Upon Concurrence With The Fire
Code Official.



(G)

(H)

(1

Section 107.3 Is Hereby Amended To Read As Follows:

The Building Official Is Authorized To Give Permission To Temporarily
Supply And Use Power In Part Of An Electric Installation Before Such
Installation Has Been Fully Completed And The Final Certificate Of
Completion Has Been Issued. The Part Covered By The Temporary
Certificate Shall Comply With The Requirements Specified For Temporary
Lighting, Heat Or Power In The National Electrical Code.

Section 108.4 Is Hereby Amended To Read As Follows:

Section 108.4 Double Fee. Where A Licensed Contractor Or An Individual
Who Has Previous Violations For Performing Work Without A Permit
Starts Or Proceeds With Work For Which A Permit Is Required By This
Code Prior To Obtaining Said Permit, The Fees Specified In Table 1-A
Shall Be Doubled. Such Fee Shall Be Paid Whether Or Not Such Permit Is
Obtained, But The Payment Of Such Fee Shall Not Relieve Any Persons
From Fully Complying With The Requirements Of This Code In The
Execution Of The Work, Nor From Any Other Penalties Prescribed Herein.

Section 108.6 Is Hereby Amended To Read As Follows:
Section 108.6 Refunds

Section 108.6.1. A Written Request For A Refund Of The Permit Fee Or
Plan Review Fee Must Be Submitted To The Building Official Within 180
Days Of The Date The Fee Was Paid.

Section 108.6.2. The Written Request Must Set Forth The Basis For The
Request For A Refund, Identify The Project For Which A Refund Is
Requested And The Request Must Be From The Same Person Or Entity
Which Paid The Fee.

Section 108.6.3. If The Foregoing Provisions Have Been Met, The
Building Official May Refund Permit Fees Or Plan Review Fees Based
Upon The Following Criteria:

Section 108.6.3 (A). If Either Or Both Fees Were Paid Or Collected
In Error, The Applicable Fees Paid Will Be Refunded.

Section 108.6.3 (B).If The Project For Which A Permit Fee Has
Been Paid Is Not To Be Constructed And No Construction Has
Commenced, Or The Request For Plan Review For Such Project Is
Being Withdrawn Before Review Of The Plans Has Occurred, The



()

(K)

(L)

Applicable Fees Paid, Minus A 20% Processing And File
Preparation Charge, Will Be Refunded.

Section 108.6.3 (C).If The Plans For The Project Have Been
Reviewed To Any Extent At The Time A Request For Refund Is
Submitted, No Refund Of Plan Review Fees Will Be Authorized.

Section 108.6.3 (D).If Permit Fees Are Paid And Any Construction
Has Been Commenced, No Refund Will Be Authorized.

Section 109.3.5 Is Hereby Amended To Read As Follows:

Lath And Gypsum Board Inspections Shall Be Made After Lathing And
Gypsum Board, Interior And Exterior, Is In Place, But Before Any
Plastering Is Applied Or Gypsum Board Joints And Fasteners Are Taped
And Finished.

Section 112 “Board Of Appeals” Is Amended To Read As Follows:
Section 112 Board Of Adjustment.

Appeals Of Orders, Decisions Or Determinations Made By The Building
Official Relative To The Application And Interpretation Of This Code May
Be Made To The Northglenn Board Of Adjustment. Appeals Shall Be In
Accordance With Section 11-42-5 Of The Northglenn Zoning Ordinance.

Table 1-A- Building Permit Fees

“Total Valuation” For The Purposes Of The Use Tax Imposed As Part Of
The Building Permit Fees Set Forth In The Schedule Below Shall Be
Based Upon Fifty Percent (50%) Of The Building Permit Valuation
Calculated Pursuant To Section 108.3.



Table 1-A- Building Permit Fees
(Fee Schedule Is Taken From The 1997 UBC)

Total Valuation Fees
$1.00 To $500.00 $23.50

$23.50 For The First $500.00 Plus $3.05 For Each
Additional $100.00 Or Fraction Thereof.

$501.00 To $2,000.00

$2,001.00 To $69.25 For The First $2,000.00 Plus $14.00 For Each
$25,000.00 Additional $1000.00 Or Fraction Thereof.
$25,001.00 To $391.25 For The First $25,000.00 Plus $10.10 For Each
$50,000.00 Additional $1,000.00 Or Fraction Thereof.
$50,001.00 To $643.75 For The First $50,000.00 Plus $7.00 For Each
$100,000.00 Additional $1,000.00 Or Fraction Thereof.
$100,001.00 To $993.75 For The First $100,000.00 Plus $5.60 For Each
$500,000.00 Additional $1,000.00 Or Fraction Thereof.
$500,001.00 To $3,233.75 For The First $500,000.00 Plus $4.75 For Each
$1,000,000.00 Additional $1,000.00 Or Fraction Thereof.

$5,608.75 For The First $1,000,000.00 Plus $3.15 For

$1,000,001.00 And Up /1" Additional $1,000.00 Or Fraction Thereof.

Other Inspections Fees:

1. Inspections Outside Of Normal Business $47.00 Per Hour* (Minimum

Hours Charge- Two Hours)

2. Reinspection Fees $47.00 Per Hour*

3. Inspections For Which No Fee Is Specifically $47.00 Per Hour* (Minimum
Indicated Charge- One-Half Hour)

4. Additional Plan Review Required By .
Changes, Additions Or Revisions To Plans $47.00 Per Hour

*Or The Total Hourly Cost To The Jurisdiction, Whichever Is Greatest.
This Cost Shall Include Supervision, Overhead, Equipment, Hourly Wages
And Fringe Benefits Of The Employees Involved.

Other Permit Fees:

Plan Check Fee=65% Of Building Permit Fee

Exemption
The Government Of The United States Of America, The State And Its Political
Subdivisions, The City, And All Agencies And Departments Thereof Shall Be
Exempt From The Payment Of Fees For Work Performed On Buildings Or
Structures Owned Wholly By Such Agencies Or Departments And Devoted To
Governmental Use.

(M)  Section 114.2 Is Hereby Amended To Read As Follows:



(N)

(©)

(P)

Q)

The Stop Work Order Shall Be In Writing And Shall Be Given To The
Owner Of The Property Involved, Or To The Owner's Agent, Or To The
Person Doing The Work, Or If No Such Person Can Be Contacted At The
Property, Posted In A Conspicuous Location On The Property Involved.
Upon Issuance Of A Stop Work Order, The Cited Work Shall Immediately
Cease. The Stop Work Order Shall Cite The Specific Code Section
Violated, State The Reason For The Order, And State The Conditions
Under Which The Cited Work Will Be Permitted To Resume.

Section 508.3.3 Is Hereby Amended To Read As Follows:

All Tenant Or Tenant Spaces Within A Multiuse Retail Center Shall Have
A Minimum Two-Hour Fire Resistance Rated Wall Between Occupancies,
Or A One-Hour Rated Wall When The Building Is Equipped With A Fire
Sprinkler System Throughout Installed In Accordance With Section
903.3.1.1; Unless The Provisions Of Section 508.3.2 For Non-Separated
Uses Is Applicable.

Section 1301.2 Is Hereby Amended To Read As Follows:

Structures Existing Prior To Adoption Of The 2006 International Building
Code, In Which There Is Work Involving Additions, Alterations, Or
Changes Of Occupancy Shall Be Made To Conform To The Requirements
Of This Chapter Or The Provisions Of Chapters 4 Through 12. The
Provisions Of Sections 1301.2.1 Through 1301.2.5 Shall Apply To Existing
Occupancies That Will Continue To Be, Or Are Proposed To Be, In
Groups A, B, E, F, M, R, And S. These Provisions Shall Not Apply To
Buildings With Occupancies In Group H Or Group |.

Section 1301.1.1 Is Hereby Amended To Read As Follows:

Buildings Shall Be Designed And Constructed In Accordance With The
International Energy Conservation Code. Conformance Shall Be
Demonstrated By Comcheck Or Rescheck Or Other Verifiable Means Of
Conformance.

Section 1612.3 Is Hereby Amended To Read As Follows:

To Establish Flood Hazard Areas, The Governing Body Shall Adopt A
Flood Hazard Map And Supporting Data. The Flood Hazard Map Shall
Include, At A Minimum, Areas Of Special Flood Hazard As ldentified By
The Federal Emergency Management Agency In An Engineering Report
Entitled “The Flood Insurance Study For Adams County, Colorado And
Incorporated Areas,” Dated March 5, 200_, As Amended Or Revised With



(R)

(S)

The Accompanying Flood Insurance Rate Map (Firm) And Floodboundary
And Floodway Map (Fbfm) And Related Supporting Data Along With Any
Revisions Thereto.

Section 2902.2 Is Hereby Amended To Read As Follows:

Where Plumbing Fixtures Are Required, Separate Facilities Shall Be
Provided For Each Sex.

Exceptions:

1. Separate Facilities Shall Not Be Required For Dwelling Units
And Sleeping Units.

2. Separate Facilities Shall Not Be Required In Structures Or
Tenant Spaces With A Total Occupant Load, Including Both
Employees And Customers, Of 15 Or Less.

3. Separate Facilities Shall Not Be Required In Mercantile
Occupancies In Which The Maximum Occupant Load Is 50 Or
Less.

4. Separate Facilities Shall Not Be Required In Group B
Occupancies In Which The Maximum Occupant Load Is 25 Or
Less.

Section 3401.3 Is Hereby Repealed In Its Entirety And Amended To Read

As Follows:

Alterations, Repairs, Additions And Changes Of Occupancy To EXxisting
Structures Shall Comply With The Provisions Of The City Of Northglenn's
Adopted Building Codes And Ordinances.

Section 10-2-6. International Building Code Appendix. The Following
Chapters Of The

Appendix Are Herein Adopted In Their Entirety:

Appendix E Entitled “Supplementary Accessibility Requirements”
Appendix F Entitled “Rodent Proofing”

Appendix | Entitled "Patio Covers"

Appendix J Entitled “Grading”



